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Dear 
 
I am writing in respect of your recent request of 19 May 2016, for the release of information 
held by the Civil Aviation Authority (CAA).  
 

Having considered your request in line with the provisions of the Environmental Information 

Regulations 2004, we are able to provide the information below. 
 

1. Can you please explain the 1,000 foot rule relating to aircraft climb rates from 
Heathrow, in particular what does 'start of role' mean?  And how is the 
departure track measured? 
 
Aircraft are required to reach a height of 1,000ft at 6.5km from the start of their 
takeoff roll, i.e. measured from the position on the runway when the aircraft begins 
its take-off run.  The distance of 6.5km is measured along the ground track flown by 
each departure, as measured from the position on the runway where the departure 
started (start of take-off roll). 

 
2. After take-off the aircraft shall not be at a height less than 1000 feet (above 

aerodrome level) at 6.5km from the start of roll as measured along the 
departure track of that aircraft.  

 

 When was this rule introduced? 
 
A height requirement has been set by the Government for noise purposes 
since 1966. The current requirement, for aircraft to be at a height of 1,000ft 
at 6.5km from start of roll, was introduced following the Government’s 
decision of 18 December 2000 on the noise limits and related noise 
monitoring arrangements to apply at the London airports. Prior to that 
decision, the requirement was that aircraft should be at a height of 1,000ft 
when passing the nearest noise monitor (some of which were not located 
close to 6.5km from start of roll). 

 

 Who monitors and enforces the rule? 
 
Although a height requirement has been set for noise purposes since 1966, it 
has never been enforced. In his December 2000 decision, the Secretary of 
State confirmed that he accepted that occasional and exceptional breaches 
of the height requirement would not be expected to lead to use of his power 
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under Section 78(2) of the Civil Aviation Act 1982 (to direct that the aircraft 
operator should be refused facilities for using the aerodrome). However, the 
airport operator monitors aircraft against this requirement and works with 
airlines with regards to their compliance. 

 

 What are the penalties for aircraft/ airlines that fail to comply with the 
rule? 
 
See previous comments above. 

 

 Can you please provide me with data for the number of aircraft that 
failed to comply with the rule, by year, for 2016, 2015 and 2014 and 
2013, broken down by airline, for Heathrow. 
 
The CAA do not hold this information. Information on the numbers of aircraft 
that fail to comply with the requirement can be found in Heathrow Airport’s 
quarterly Flight Performance Data Reports, which are available to download 
at http://www.heathrow.com/noise/facts,-stats-and-reports/reports 

 

 Can you please provide me with details of what fines or other penalties 
were applied to the airlines breaking this rule in these years. 
 
See previous comments above. 

 

 Who is responsible for reviewing the rule, given changes to technology 
etc? 
 
The rule is imposed by the Department for Transport.  Any review, would be 
initiated by the Department for Transport. 

 

 Can you please provide me with a copy of the last review of this rule 
and any recommendations that followed. 
 
Please find attached a copy of the Government’s decision of 18 December 
2000.  

 
3. Can you please provide me with information showing the possible climb rates 

(technically possible) of different types of modern aircraft, as typically used 
by Heathrow. 

 
The CAA do not hold this information.  Procedures are designed specifying 
minimum rates of climb. However, for your information we have attached departure 
profile graphs for a sample of common aircraft types at Heathrow. 

 
4. Can you please provide me with information about how the decibel level on 

the ground of typical aircraft changes with the height from take off or at least 
illustrate with one common plane currently in use e.g. every 500ft up to 
7,000ft. 
 
Please find attached a set of ‘noise-power-distance’ (NPD) curves which show the 
noise level received on the ground as a function of distance from the sound source 
and engine power setting, in this case for the Airbus A320 on departure (the A320 is 
the most common type in operation at Heathrow). NPD curves account for both 
noise emissions as well as atmospheric sound propagation effects.   Care needs to 
be used when interpreting such data.  The height that an aircraft can achieve at a 
given point after departure will be dependent on the performance capability of the 
aircraft, how heavily it is loaded and prevailing atmospheric conditions.  Secondly, to 

http://www.heathrow.com/noise/facts,-stats-and-reports/reports
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achieve a greater altitude may require an aircraft to use more engine power emitting 
more noise, and/or fly more slowly, increasing the duration of the noise event.   

 
5. Can you please provide information for a typical type of plane using Heathrow 

about how fuel usage varies according to the rate of climb. 
 

It is not possible to provide such information, since there is no direction association 
between fuel usage and rate of climb, since many factors affect rate of climb that are 
independent of fuel usage.     

 
6. Can you please provide me with information about rules for rates of climb for 

comparable airports in other countries, where the CAA has this information. 
 
We do not hold information regarding rules for rates of climb for airports outside the 
UK.   

 
7. What oversight does the CAA or any other body have for the commercial 

contracts between airlines and airline lease companies that dictate rates of 
climb? 

 
The CAA has safety oversight for UK airline operators.  Minimum rates of climb and 
minimum altitudes are specified at specific locations and for specific flight 
procedures in order to ensure safety with respect to obstacles on the ground.  
Beyond that, how an aircraft is operated is a matter for the airline concerned 
provided it is in accordance with the aircraft manufacturer's limitations.  

 

If you are not satisfied with how we have dealt with your request in the first instance you 

should approach the CAA in writing at:- 
 
Caroline Chalk 
Head of External Information Services 
Civil Aviation Authority 
Aviation House 
Gatwick Airport South  
Gatwick 
RH6 0YR 
 
caroline.chalk@caa.co.uk 
 
The CAA has a formal internal review process for dealing with appeals or complaints in 

connection with requests under the Environmental Information Regulations.  The key steps 

in this process are set in the attachment. 

Should you remain dissatisfied with the outcome you have a right to appeal against the 
decision by contacting the Information Commissioner at:- 
 
Information Commissioner’s Office 

FOI/EIR Complaints Resolution 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

SK9 5AF 

https://ico.org.uk/concerns/  

 

 

 

mailto:caroline.chalk@caa.co.uk
https://ico.org.uk/concerns/
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If you wish to request further information from the CAA, please use the form on the CAA 
website at http://publicapps.caa.co.uk/modalapplication.aspx?appid=24.  
 
Yours sincerely 
 

 
 
Rihanne Stephen 
Information Rights Officer 

http://publicapps.caa.co.uk/modalapplication.aspx?appid=24
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CAA INTERNAL REVIEW & COMPLAINTS PROCEDURE 
 
 
 The original case to which the appeal or complaint relates is identified and the case 

file is made available; 

 The appeal or complaint is allocated to an Appeal Manager, the appeal is 

acknowledged and the details of the Appeal Manager are provided to the applicant; 

 The Appeal Manager reviews the case to understand the nature of the appeal or 

complaint, reviews the actions and decisions taken in connection with the original 

case and takes account of any new information that may have been received.  This 

will typically require contact with those persons involved in the original case and 

consultation with the CAA Legal Department; 

 The Appeal Manager concludes the review and, after consultation with those involved 

with the case, and with the CAA Legal Department, agrees on the course of action to 

be taken; 

 The Appeal Manager prepares the necessary response and collates any information 

to be provided to the applicant; 

 The response and any necessary information is sent to the applicant, together with 

information about further rights of appeal to the Information Commissioners Office, 

including full contact details. 
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